

Project Name: 2013 Water Meters Purchase

Bids Opened July 23, 2013 2:00pm

Schedule "A"				HD Supply		Ferguson Waterworks		Hydro Specialties Co.	
Item No.	Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
1	¾-inch Meter w/Register	27	EA	\$ 100.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 146.00	\$ 3,942.00	\$ 114.92	\$ 3,102.84
2	1-inch Meter w/Register	552	EA	\$ 133.33	\$ 73,598.16	\$ 146.00	\$ 80,592.00	\$ 146.73	\$ 80,994.96
TOTAL FOR BID SCHEDULE "A"					\$ 76,298.16		\$ 84,534.00		\$ 84,097.80
Schedule "B"									
3	1-inch Register	136	EA	\$ 61.18	\$ 8,320.48	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4	1 ½-inch Register	175	EA	\$ 61.18	\$ 10,706.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
5	2" Register	126	EA	\$ 61.18	\$ 7,708.68	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6	4" Register	5	EA	\$ 61.18	\$ 305.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
TOTAL FOR BID SCHEDULE "B"					\$ 27,041.56		NO BID		NO BID
TOTAL FOR BID SCHEDULE					\$ 103,339.72		\$ 84,534.00		\$ 84,097.80